
NAOMI - RUTH CONNECTION 

LESSON SEVENTY-NINE COMMENTS 

 
Dear Loved Ones,  
 
AŌer almost 2 years, our amazing story of Naomi and Ruth has a conclusion of lessons that Sandy Harber 
has so faithfully provided.  I am in awe of the research she has done and the amazing 79 lessons that she 
has given us to review.  I never would have guessed that she could get so much out of 4 chapters of one 
story.  I have learned so much about God’s love, redempƟon, and perfect plan for our lives when we 
give him the opportunity to control our lives.  I hope you have enjoyed these lessons as much as I have.   
 
Sandy is working on some other subjects and has many lessons already prepared. You will hear more 
about this soon. 
 
For Sandy and me, it means that we have become friends and shared so much as sisters in Christ 
through our mutual loss of our dear loved husbands two years ago.  We will conƟnue to seek God’s 
direcƟon for what else He may have in store for us.  We know that God is not finished.  He sƟll wants to 
use our life changing experiences to deepen our walk with Him as well as to share His love in a new 
way.  Many of you have had similar stories of loss, heartache, or tragedies in your lives.  Isn’t it great to 
know that God understands, cares and always has a greater plan.  He longs to draw us closer to Him so 
that He can use our stories for our good and His glory.   
 
Thank you so much for being a part of this adventure with us.  We will conƟnue to pray that you will see 
God in work in your lives in a very special way.  When you are tempted to feel biƩer as Naomi did, or 
when you feel confused about what is in store next in your life, as Ruth must have felt, we hope you 
trust Him to provide wisdom, strength, and all your needs.  We hope you will be reminded of Naomi and 
Ruth’s story when you the enemy tries to discourage you.  There is always Hope in Jesus.  If you have 
struggled with biƩerness or loneliness, please give God a chance to renew your perspecƟve through His 
love and desire to heal your heart and give you a new life. 
 
Our redeemer is sƟll at work in our lives.  He has so much to offer us if we just reach out to Him.  We 
may not see everything in our lives become all that we would think is best for us, but God knows what 
we need and is ready to provide a joy-filled future here on earth or/and in Heaven. He will give us all the 
instrucƟons we need to get the most out of our lives by turning to Him for guidance.  
 John 13:17, “If ye know these things, happy are ye if ye do them.” 
 
I hope and pray that your days ahead will hold boundless peace, love, and joy as you follow God each 
day. May you be abundantly blessed and may your life show His love to others.  Always remember, you 
are very loved. 
 
Love and Prayers, 
Sandy Yates 
 


